
City of Leavenworth

Bid Tabulation

Project or Purchase:  Project - Cody Park Renovation 

Bid Opening Date:  02/06/2024

Bid Opening Time:  3:00 PM

Bidder Address (City/State) Responsive Bidder Base Bid

Alternate 1 

Deduct

Alternate 2  

Deduct

Alternate 3 

Deduct

Alternate 4  

Deduct Alternate 5

Alternate 6   

Deduct

Alternate 7  

Deduct

MultiSports Wichita, KS Yes $1,007,364.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hartline Kansas City, MO Yes $1,463,380.00 $45,970.00 $23,365.00 $9,000.00 $15,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

BKM Leavenworth, KS Yes $1,102,856.00 $195,386.00 $36,222.00 $9,900.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sands Construction Leavenworth, KS Yes $724,000.00 $80,000.00 $17,700.00 $9,000.00 $0.00 -$2,000.00 $4,015.00 No Bid

Precision Constructionand Contracting Lee's Summit, MO Yes $1,494,831.00 No Bid No Bid $8,000.00 $13,440.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

McConnell & Associates North Kansas City, MO Yes $795,878.00 $67,134.00 $14,250.00 $9,900.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

All bids are subject to review and approval by City Staff and/or the City Commission


